
F281-629 (Rev. 5/92) 19-19016
 

SAN ANTONIO WATER SYSTEM
P. O. BOX 2449

SAN ANTONIO, TEXAS  78298-2449
TABULATION OF BIDS

PROPOSAL  

FOR: Purchase of Various Types of Light Duty Trucks

TIME &  

DATE: 3:00 p.m., March 12, 2019
  

ITEM NO. DESCRIPTION AND APPROXIMATE QUANTITY

18 ea.   *     

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, UNIT PRICE 23,843.00 24,118.00 23,540.00 24,546.15 26,861.65 27,985.00 28,071.00

club, double, super cab pickup TOTAL 429,174.00 434,124.00 423,720.00 441,830.70 483,509.70 503,730.00 505,278.00

A. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL   Ram 1500 Chev CC15753LD Ford F350 Toyota Tundra 2019 Ford F150

1 ea.      *  

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x2 wide and long bed (no outside fenders) extended, UNIT PRICE      29,500.00 31,692.00

club, double, super cab pickup with mounted 1,000 powered liftgate TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 29,500.00 31,692.00

B. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL      Toyota Tundra 2019 Ford F150

9 ea.    *

6,300 GVWR (minimum) 4x4 wide and short bed (no outside fenders) extended, UNIT PRICE DOES NOT DOES NOT  27,844.15 29,956.95 31,222.00 31,090.00

club, double, super cab pickup TOTAL MEET MEET NO BID 250,597.35 269,612.55 280,998.00 279,810.00

C. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL SPECIFICATIONS SPECIFICATIONS  Chev CK15753LD Ford F550  2019 Ford F150

1 ea.   *

14 GVWR (minimum) DRW, 4x2 wide and long type bed (no outside fenders) UNIT PRICE       45,714.00

extended cab pickup truck TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 45,714.00

D. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL       2019 Ford F150

1 ea.   *

11,000 GVWR (minimum) 2x4 wide and long type bed (no outside fenders) UNIT PRICE       34,710.00

crew cab pickup truck TOTAL NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 34,710.00

E. State Make, Model MAKE/MODEL       2019 Ford F150

2% 2% Net Net Net Net Net

Terms 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days 30 days

  

Delivery Days 90-120 days 90-120 days 120-150 days 120 days 90-120 days  110-125 days

*LOW BIDDER

 

BID INVITATIONS WERE E-MAILED TO AND/OR PICKED UP BY:

 

  

Ancira Chrysler Jeep Lone Star Chrysler Demandstar

Ancira Motor North Park Toyota SAWS Website

Bluebonnet Chrysl Dodge Northside Chevrolet

Bluebonnet Ford Red McCombs Toyota Ford

Caldwell Country Chev Sam Packs Five Star Ford

Grande Truck Center Silsbee Ford

Grapevine Sport City Toyota

Gunn Chevrolet Toyota of Boerne

Jordan Ford
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